
 

 
 
DATE:     BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
     October 5, 2011   Margarine, Butter & Bulk Ground Beef, RFP #121003 
           
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A seven (7) month pricing agreement to provide margarine, butter and bulk ground beef for use in the 
preparation of breakfast and lunch items as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for 
school cafeterias throughout the District.  Three (3) items bid and awarded.  Items will be purchased 
as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting 
specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  November 1, 2011 through May 31, 2012. 
 
 
 
 

 
REQUESTED BY: 
 

     Food Services 
 

            
SUPPLIER NAME:                ITEMS:   ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE 
 

Butler Foods, Pensacola, FL    1        $    52,800.00 
US Foodservice-Lakeland, Lakeland, FL   2   87,500.00 
   

  
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:     FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$140,300.00 Est. / 7 Mos.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

 
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received:  3        
 

 
POSTING DATE & TIME: 
      
     October 5, 2011, 4:45 pm Central Time 
 
9500 PUR100 (11/10) Retention – 5 Years 

 
 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: 9-26-2011

BID NBR: 121003
BID TITLE: Margarine, Butter & Bulk Ground Beef

ITEM
lb lb Bulk lb

Quantity: 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 600 cs
0516370 0516382 0516140

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3
Butler Foods 0.8800 a 2.6500 a No bid
Pensacola, FL 26.40 y 95.40 y
JNS Foods No bid No bid 1.9400 a
Tamarac, FL 1.90 77.60 u
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid 1.8983 2.5500
Lakeland, FL 56.95 51.00

a = Alternate product bid
u = Unacceptable (Alternate product or pack size not accepted or product was not sent for testing.)
y = Yes, sample was received/tested and was approved

Butter Gr. Beef,

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/ 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herin are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Margarine
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